
CCSD December 13 2010 Regular Board Meeting 
Table of Contents

 Agenda 3
Accept Certification by San Luis Obispo County Clerk-Recorder
of November 2, 2010 Election Results

SR 1 E Cert Election Results 11210 6
SR 1 E SLO Co Election Results 7

MANAGER'S REPORT
SR 6 A GM Report 14
SR 6 A VSA Oct Nov Rpt 15
SR 6 A Finance Mgr Rpt 17
SR 6 A Finance Mgr Rpt Debt Sched 20
SR 6 A UM Rpt 21
SR 6 A 2010 San Simeon Creek Well Levels 22
SR 6 A Fire Chief Rpt 23
Fire Stats November 24

DESALINATION AND WATER STORAGE FACILITIES
REPORT - General Manager and/or District Engineer

SR 6 B Desal Water Fac Rpt 25
Approve Expenditures for Month of November 2010

SR 7 A Expenditure Rpt November 2010 26
SR 7 A Expenditure Rpt Dept Codes 32

Approve Minutes of Board of Directors Meeting, Nov 10, 2010
SR 7 B DRAFT CCSD Mins 111010 33

Consider Adoption of Resolution 62-2010 Authorizing Banking
Powers

SR 7 C Approve Bank Signers Report 36
SR 7 C Reso 62 2010 Appv Bank Signers HOB 37
SR 7 C Bank Powers Attachment 38

Consider Resolution 63-2010 Authorizing the Establishment of a
Non-Interest Bearing Account at Heritage Oaks Bank

SR 7 D Appv Overflow CCSD Bank Acct HOB 40
SR 7 D Reso 63-2010 Overflow HOB Acct 42

Consider Adoption of Resolution 64-2010 Authorizing Special
Depository Agreement with Heritage Oaks Bank

SR 7 E Appv Special Depository Agmnt HOB 43
SR 7 E Reso 64 HOB Special Depository Agmnt 44

Cast Ballot Electing Muril Clift as Special District Member to
Local Agency Formation Commission (LAFCO) Term Expiring
December 2012

SR 7 F Cast Ballot LAFCO Clift 45
SR 7 F LAFCO Ballot 46

Consider Nomination of Muril Clift as Special District Member to
the SLO County Integrated Waste Management Authority
(IWMA)

SR 7 G IWMA Nomination of Clift 47
SR 7 G IWMA112310NomsEmail 48

1



Public Hearing to Adopt Ordinance 02-2010 of the Board of
Directors of the Cambria Community Services District Amending
CCSD Code Chapter 6.04 and Adopting and Amending the
2010 Edition of the California Fire Code and 2009 Edition of the
International Wildland Urban Interface Code and the National
Fire Protection Association Standard 1144

SR 8 A Adopt Ord 02 2010 50
SR 8 A Ord Fire Code 2010 53
SR 8 A Resolution 61 2010 Fire Code Findings 59
SR 8 A Fire Code Attach2 Findings 61

Consider Adoption of Resolution 65-2010 Authorizing a Water
Loan Expenditure of $20,000 from CCSD Reserves and
Awarding Contract to Bartle Wells Associates for Financial
Consulting Services

SR 9 A Author Water Loan Exp of GF Reserves Award
Contract Bartle Wells Financial Consulting 67
SR 9 A Reso 65 2010
AuthWaterLoanBartleWellsContract 69
SR 9 A Bartle Wells Assoc Proposal 70

Preliminary Discussion of 2011 CCSD Board Goals
SR 9 B Prelim Disc 2011 CCSD Board Goals 83

Appoint Ad Hoc Committee for CCSD Coordination of Services
with Cambria Community Healthcare District CCHD)

SR 9 C Appoint Ad Hoc Comm CCSD CCHD
Coordination of Svcs 84

2



   

 
CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 

REGULAR MEETING 
Monday, December 13, 2010– 12:30 PM 

VETERANS MEMORIAL BUILDING, 1000 MAIN ST., CAMBRIA, CA 

 
AGENDA 

This agenda is prepared and posted pursuant to Government Code Section 54954.2. By listing a topic on 
this agenda, the District’s Board of Directors has expressed its intent to discuss and act on each item. In 
addition to any action identified in the summary description of each item, the action that may be taken by 
the Board of Directors shall include: a referral to staff with specific requests for information; continuance; 
specific direction to staff concerning the policy or mission of the item; discontinuance of consideration; 
authorization to enter into negotiations and execute agreements pertaining to the item; adoption or 
approval; and disapproval. 
 
Copies of the staff reports or other documentation relating to each item of business referred to on the 
agenda are on file in the Office of the District Clerk, available for public inspection during District business 
hours. If requested, the agenda and supporting documents shall be made available in alternative formats 
to persons with a disability. The District Clerk will answer any questions regarding the agenda. 
 
1. OPENING  

A. Call to Order 
B. Pledge of Allegiance 
C. Establishment of Quorum 
D. Report from Closed Session 
E. Accept Certification by San Luis Obispo County Clerk of November 2, 2010 
 Election Results 
F. Administer Oath of Office to Newly Elected Directors 
G. Election of Officers 
 

2. SPECIAL REPORTS  
A. SHERIFF’S DEPARTMENT REPORT 

(Estimated Time: 5 minutes) 
 

3. ACKNOWLEDGMENTS/PRESENTATIONS – None  
 

4. AGENDA REVIEW: ADDITIONS/DELETIONS AND PULLED CONSENT ITEMS 
(Estimated Time: 5 minutes) 

 
5. PUBLIC COMMENT PERIOD FOR ITEMS NOT ON THE AGENDA 

Members of the public may now address the Board on any item of interest within 
the jurisdiction of the Board but not on its agenda today. In compliance with the 
Brown Act, the Board cannot discuss or act on items not on the agenda. Each 
speaker has up to three minutes. Speaker slips (available at the entry) should be 
submitted to the District Clerk. 

(Estimated Time: 20 minutes) 
  
 

3



CCSD Agenda 
Monday, December 13, 2010 
Page 2 

6. MANAGER’S AND BOARD REPORTS 
A. MANAGER'S REPORT 

 
B. DESALINATION AND WATER STORAGE FACILITIES REPORT - 

General Manager and/or District Engineer 
 

C. MEMBER AND COMMITTEE REPORTS 
(Estimated Time: 10 minutes) 

 
7. CONSENT AGENDA  

All matters on the consent calendar are to be approved by one motion. If 
Directors wish to discuss a consent item other than simple clarifying questions, a 
request for removal may be made. Such items are pulled for separate discussion 
and action after the consent calendar as a whole is acted upon. 
 
A. Approve Expenditures for Month of November 2010 

 
B. Approve Minutes of Board of Directors Meeting, November 10, 2010 

 
C. Consider Adoption of Resolution 62-2010 Authorizing Banking Powers 

 
D. Consider Resolution 63-2010 Authorizing the Establishment of a Non-

Interest Bearing Account at Heritage Oaks Bank 
 

E. Consider Adoption of Resolution 64-2010 Authorizing Special Depository 
Agreement with Heritage Oaks Bank 
 

F. Cast Ballot Electing Muril Clift as Special District Member to Local Agency 
Formation Commission (LAFCO) Term Expiring December 2012 
 

G. Consider Nomination of Muril Clift as Special District Member to the SLO 
County Integrated Waste Management Authority (IWMA) 
 

(Estimated Time: 15 minutes) 
 

8. HEARINGS AND APPEALS 
 

A. Public Hearing to Adopt Ordinance 02-2010 of the Board of Directors of 
the Cambria Community Services District Amending CCSD Code Chapter 
6.04 and Adopting and Amending the 2010 Edition of the California Fire 
Code and 2009 Edition of the International Wildland Urban Interface Code 
and the National Fire Protection Association Standard 1144 
 

(Estimated Time: 15 minutes) 
 
 
 
 

4



CCSD Agenda 
Monday, December 13, 2010 
Page 3 

9. REGULAR BUSINESS 
 
A. Consider Adoption of Resolution 65-2010 Authorizing a Water Loan 

Expenditure of $20,000 from CCSD Reserves and Awarding Contract to 
Bartle Wells Associates for Financial Consulting Services 
 

B. Preliminary Discussion of 2011 CCSD Board Goals 
 

C. Consideration of Formation of Ad Hoc Committee for CCSD Coordination 
of Services with Cambria Community Healthcare District (CCHD) 
 

(Estimated Time: 30 minutes) 
 

10. PUBLIC COMMENT 
Members of the public may now address the Board on any item of interest within 
the jurisdiction of the Board but not on its agenda today. In compliance with the 
Brown Act, the Board cannot discuss or act on items not on the agenda. Each 
speaker has up to three minutes. Speaker slips (available at the entry) should be 
submitted to the District Clerk. 

 
11. ADJOURN 

5



CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 1.E. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
  Kathy Choate, District Clerk 
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010 Subject: Accept Certification by San Luis Obispo  
        County Clerk-Recorder of November 2,  
        2010 Election Results 
 
RECOMMENDATIONS: 
 
Accept certification by the SLO County Clerk-Recorder of the November 2, 2010 election 
results. 
 
FISCAL IMPACT: 
 
None. 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 
Attached is the certification and final official results by Julie L. Rodewald, County Clerk-
Recorder of the County of San Luis Obispo for the votes cast at the Consolidated General 
Election in the Cambria Community Services District on November 2, 2010. 
 
Jim Bahringer and Michael Thompson were elected to serve on the Cambria Community 
Services District Board of Directors, with their terms of office expiring December 5, 2014. 
 
 
Attachments: Certificate of County Clerk-Recorder and Statement of Votes Cast 
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
 
UNANIMOUS:   ___ CLIFT ___ BAHRINGER ___ DE MICCO ___ MACKINNON ___THOMPSON ___ 
 
 
 
 
 
 

6



7



8



9



10



11



12



13



 CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 6.A. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010   Subject: MANAGER’S REPORT 
 
ADMINISTRATION 
Reminder:  Next month’s regular Board meeting is scheduled on the third Thursday, January 
20th at 12:30 p.m., here at the Vets Hall. 
 
FEDERAL ADVOCATE – VAN SCOYOC ASSOCIATES 
The CCSD federal advocate’s combined October and November monthly report is attached. 
 
HOLIDAY NOTICE 
CCSD administrative offices and utility field operations will be closed in observance of the New 
Year’s holiday on Friday, December 31, 2010.  Service interruptions and emergencies may be 
reported by calling our 24-hour answering service at 927-6223. 
 
VOLUNTARY LOT MERGER PROGRAM 
Last month, when I presented the quarterly report (through September 2010), I inadvertently 
failed to recognize Ben Bouldin, who leads the PROS Commission’s Open Space Voluntary 
Lot Merger Program Ad Hoc Committee.  Per Board direction, Ben’s committee is responsible 
for implementation oversight of the Buildout Reduction Program, which includes voluntary lot 
mergers.  Their input is valuable. 
 
PARKS AND RECREATION 
PROS COMMISSION* 
The PROS Commission met on December 7th.  The next regular meeting is scheduled for 
Tuesday, March 1, 2011, at 10:00AM, at the Cambria Vets Hall (Dining Room).   
 
*The PROS Commission meets quarterly on the 1st Tuesday:  September, December, March, and June.   

14



15



16



 BOARD OF DIRECTORS’ MEETING-DECEMBER 13, 2010 
ADDENDUM TO GENERAL MANAGER’S REPORT 

FINANCE MANAGER’S REPORT 
 
 
EXPENDITURES-There were no disbursements in excess of $100,000 during November, 2010. 
 
RESERVES-LAIF BALANCE-The balance in the Local Agency Investment Fund as of November 30, 
2010 was $4,048,432.  This balance is an increase of $50,000 from October 31, 2010 and an increase of 
$478,175 from November 30, 2009.  This represents the thirteenth consecutive month that the balance 
was higher than for the same month one year prior.  In fact, the balance in LAIF has been higher than 
the balance for the same month two years prior from August 31, 2010 to present. 
 

The LAIF Balance is made up as follows (restrictions, if applicable, are noted): 
 

   FUND        AMOUNT 
  General      $ 3,815,981 
  General (Prop. 1A)     $    159,286 
  Resource Conservation (Lot Merger Program) $      45,551 
  Water       $        -0- 
  Wastewater (Capital)     $      27,614 
 
INVESTMENTS-Questions and or comments have been made regarding whether or not the CCSD can 
obtain a better return on its funds currently deposited in LAIF.  Following is an analysis of how much 
might available for investment (and how this amount was determined) as well as potential rates of 
return: 
 
The CCSD just passed the period where the balance in LAIF is typically at its lowest balance of the 
year.  As previously reported, this is mainly due to the timing of property tax revenues and to a lesser 
degree, the timing of some significant payments.  The lowest balance in LAIF in the last 12 months was 
$3,793,122 as of September 15, 2010.  (Typically, the lowest balance of the year in LAIF occurs during 
the first two weeks of November.  While this was not the case this year, the second lowest balance of the 
year of $3,848,432 did occur as of November 1, 2010).  For comparison, the highest balance in LAIF 
during this period was $5,060,093 as of April 29, 2010.  During the past 12 months, there were no 
significant items of revenue or expenditure other than from the results of normal operations.  Since the 
balance in LAIF is increasing, it would be appropriate to use the balance of $3,800,000 as the starting 
point to arrive at the amount available for investment.  This means that if up to $3,800,000 was 
deposited in somewhat non-liquid investments, the CCSD should still be able to timely pay all of its 
obligations related to normal operations.  However, this would not allow for any material payments 
made for such activities as material Capital Improvement Projects if such obligations occurred during 
the period when the CCSD’s cash balance is at its lowest.  
 
For the month of October, 2010, the interest rate in LAIF was 0.48%.  Currently, Rabobank offers a 
money market account that pays 0.15% higher than LAIF and Heritage Oaks Bank (HOB) offers a 
money market account that pays up to 0.75% depending on the amount on deposit.  Rabobank currently 
offers an interest rate of 0.65% on a 12-month certificate of deposit (CD), while HOB’s rate is 0.80%.  
HOB did express that there was a possibility that they would be willing to negotiate a higher interest rate 
if a large amount was deposited.  Note-all rates quoted are subject to change.  If $3,000,000 were 

17



invested in the Rabobank money market account at the rate noted above, the CCSD would receive 
$4,500 in additional interest income over a year’s time.  If $3,000,000 were invested in the HOB money 
market account at the rate noted above, the CCSD would receive $8,100 in additional interest income 
over a year’s time.  However, funds on deposit in interest-bearing accounts in excess of $250,000 are not 
insured by the FDIC.  In order to obtain FDIC coverage for $3,000,000, the CCSD would need to 
deposit $250,000 with twelve financial institutions.  Besides being very time-consuming to implement 
and track, during the past year or two when inquires have been made of other (than HOB and Rabobank) 
local banks within SLO County when they have run specials promotions on CDs that offered superior 
rates, it was found that the banks did not accept public funds for such accounts.  It has also been found 
that large, national banks are not offering any competitive rates.  Other than potentially opening a money 
market account at Rabobank in the amount of $250,000 as referenced in another item on today’s agenda, 
the CCSD Finance Ad Hoc Committee and Staff has determined that it is in the CCSD’s best interest to 
leave its funds in LAIF at this time.  Staff will continue to monitor investment opportunities and they 
will be reported on as conditions change. 
 
The CCSD’s current Investment Policy does not allow more than 30% of its investment portfolio to be 
invested in certificates of deposits.  The Investment Policy is silent as to Money Market accounts, but as 
these are basically checking accounts, it seems appropriate to invest CCSD funds in them if it is 
determined to be in the best interests of the CCSD.   
 
INTERNAL LOANS-As of November, 2010, the CCSD Board of Directors approved the following 
internal loans and the indicated amounts have been disbursed: 
          

                                 AMOUNT    
                         LOAN               OF LOAN    
LENDING BORROWING           AMOUNT                DISBURSED    PURPOSE 
    FUND            FUND         AUTHORIZED             TO DATE             OF LOAN       
   General        Water  $  166,000    $  166,000          ACE Matching 
   General        Water  $    60,000    $    60,000               SCADA 
   General    Wastewater  $    15,000    $        -0-              SCADA 
   General        Water  $    34,000    $        -0- Western Main Street Overlay 
   General    Wastewater  $      4,000    $        -0- Western Main Street Overlay 
   General        Water  $    30,000    $        -0-  Stuart Street Tank & Rodeo  

Grounds Pump Station         
Environmental Review 

   General        Water  $    17,000    $        -0-  Stuart Street Tank & Rodeo  
Grounds Pump Station         
Environmental Review 

 
Total Authorized Loans from the General Fund to the Water Fund:           $   307,000 
Total Authorized Loans from the General Fund to the Wastewater Fund:           $     19,000 
 
At this time, it appears that the Wastewater Fund will have sufficient funds to pay the all of projected 
expenditures related to the aforementioned costs without the need to borrow from the General Fund 
while the Water Fund will be able to pay a portion of the costs.  While the final determination will be 
made after all other Fiscal Year 2009/2010 activity is recorded and reconciled, the $15,000 previously 
shown as loan funds disbursed for Wastewater’s SCADA costs is now shown as zero disbursed to reflect 
the expected final outcome. 

18



 
EXTERNAL LOANS-As of November 30, 2010, the CCSD external debt is as shown per the 
attachment, including interest rates and prepayment penalty provisions. 
 
 
 

19



DESCRIPTION> Pierce Dash Pumper
Bank Note (Funds 

2006 Refund of 1995 
Bonds)-65% Water

Bank Note (Funds 
2006 Refund of 1995 
Bonds)-35% Sewer

Bank Note (Funds 
2006 Refund of 1999 

Bonds)*

State Revolving Fund 
Loan

DEBT HOLDER> OshKosh Capital Citizens Bank Citizens Bank City National Bank SWRCB

ORIGINAL PRINCIPAL> 477,223.85                 1,233,375.00              664,125.00                 2,245,000.00              2,592,324.38              

INTEREST RATE> 5.09% 4.50% 4.50% 4.55% 3.00%

FUND> General Water Wastewater Wastewater Wastewater

DEPARTMENT> Fire Water Wastewater Wastewater Wastewater

FINAL PAYMENT DATE> 5/19/2016 5/1/2015 5/1/2015 9/23/2023 5/28/2016

AVERAGE ANNUAL PAYMENT(S)> 49,065.96                   184,211.30                 99,190.70                   164,416.65                 174,056.80                 

PRINCIPAL BALANCE @ 11/30/10> 248,328.51                 695,825.00                 374,675.00                 1,585,000.00              942,781.16                 

PROJECTED BALANCE @ 6/30/11> 211,902.47                 542,945.00                 292,355.00                 1,585,000.00              797,008.00                 

PROJECTED BALANCE @ 6/30/12> 173,622.35                 383,175.00                 206,325.00                 1,497,000.00              646,861.00                 

PROJECTED BALANCE @ 6/30/13> 133,393.77                 216,190.00                 116,410.00                 1,403,000.00              492,210.00                 

PROJECTED BALANCE @ 6/30/14> 91,117.55                   41,665.00                   22,435.00                   1,303,000.00              332,920.00                 

PREPAYMENT PENALTY>  Yes-2% of current 
principal balance No No

 Yes-Not allowed until 
10/1/13, 3% from 

10/1/13-4/1/16, 2% 
from 10/1/16-4/1/20, 
none after 10/1/20 

No

*Refinanced as of September 23, 2010 with a private placement loan at an interest rate of 4.55%.

BOARD OF DIRECTORS' MEETING-DECEMBER 13, 2010

FINANCE MANAGER'S REPORT ATTACHEMENT
ADDENDUM TO GENERAL MANAGER'S REPORT

SCHEDULE OF LONG-TERM DEBT

20



 
BOARD OF DIRECTORS’ MEETING-DECEMBER 13, 2010 

ADDENDUM TO GENERAL MANAGER’S REPORT 
UTILITIES MANAGER’S REPORT  

 
 
 
My first month as Utilities Manager has been very productive and I appreciate the support I 
have received from the General Manager, CCSD staff, and the community. I have listed below 
several projects that I am working on for the CCSD.  
 

1. Continue to work closely with the Water, Wastewater, Facilities and Resources staff on 
thoroughly understanding each department’s daily operations and facilities while 
focusing on costs, efficiency and collectively working together as a team. 

2. Implemented bi-weekly meetings with Water, Wastewater, Facilities and Resources 
supervisors to discussed and address matters within their Departments. 

3. Attend weekly safety meetings at the Wastewater Treatment Plant. 
4. Establishing my office within the administrative facilities and work closely to support the 

General Manager and staff while learning Administrative Policies and Procedures, 
Finance, Engineering, and Human Resources. Continue to act as a conduit between the 
Water, Wastewater, Facilities and Resources staff and Administration. 

5. Continue to improve the overall appearance of the Water and Wastewater facilities. 
6. Introduce and meet key stakeholders within the County of San Luis Obispo that will be 

instrumental in assisting the CCSD with current and future projects and contracts.  
7. Met with Dave Flynn, Deputy Public Works Director for San Luis Obispo County and 

Ben Boer to discuss the Main Street Bridge replacement project, Creek Restoration 
project, Cross Town Trail project as it relates to the Dog Park area, and a formal 
maintenance agreement with the CCSD and the County for the use of the Rodeo 
Grounds adjacent to the Water Plant that is currently being used as a staging area and 
satellite field office.  

8. Met with Paul Porter, Technical Supervisor for the County of San Luis Obispo, 
representatives from Coast Electronics, and CCSD staff from Fire and Water to discuss 
the current radio contract the CCSD has with the County in addition to overall 
communications within the CCSD and the radio room vault adjacent to the Stuart Street 
Tanks.  

9. Met with representatives from Rockwell Construction Services and CCSD staff from 
Fire, Wastewater and Engineering to discuss the CCSD’S SCADA system  

10. Met with Chris Adams, Superintendant for the Coast Unified School District to discuss 
the SR4 contract, and the proposed concept of the CCSD and the School District 
partnering with sharing facilities for the purpose of enhancing Park and Recreation 
opportunities within the community.  

11. I am reviewing documentation associated with Veterans Hall Fee’s, parcels currently 
owned by the CCSD and associated taxes levied by the County against those 
properties, Water and Wastewater Standby Fees and the Sanitary Sewer Maintenance 
Program.  

 
In closing, due to the amount of precipitation we have received over the past month the current 
Water Well levels are above average. The graphing and tracking of those well levels can be 
found on the CCSD Website.  The San Simeon Creek Well level graph is attached. 

21



0.00 

5.00 

10.00 

15.00 

20.00 

25.00 

30.00 

M
A

R.

A
PR

L

M
A

Y

JU
N

E

JU
LY

A
U

G
.

SE
PT

O
CT

.

N
O

V.

D
EC

.

JA
N

.

FE
B.

M
A

R.

E
L
E
V
A
T
I
O
N
 
A
B
O
V
E
 
S
E
A
 
L
E
V
E
L

SAN SIMEON CREEK WELL LEVELS
March 15th. 1988 - December 1st, 2010

PREVIOUS HIGHS PREVIOUS LOWS AVERAGE 2010

22



 
BOARD OF DIRECTORS’ MEETING  

ADDENDUM TO GENERAL MANAGER’S REPORT 
FIRE CHIEF’S REPORT 

 
 

Response information is attached and represents activities for the month of October 2010.  
 
Progress updates and highlights regarding the different programs and services our department 
provides are identified below: 
 
Prevention and Education (October 2010) 
 

• 02 residential new and remodel fire plan reviews were completed. 
• 14 residential and commercial technical fire inspections were conducted.  
• 07 residential and commercial water appliance/conservation inspections were conducted. 
• 16 engine company commercial fire and life safety inspections were conducted. 
• 17 public education event 
• 03 residential smoke detectors were installed and/or the batteries changed. 

 
Operations 
The CCSD Fire Department (CCSDFD) has received official notification that the grant application 
to fund replacement of the department’s aging reserve engine was denied.  The CCSDFD had 
requested grant funding through the Assistance to Firefighters Grant (AFG) program to replace 
reserve engine 5797 a 22-year-old FMC type I engine.  The grant request was for $358,000 and 
would have been a 95% funded opportunity. 
 
Prevention 
After the conclusion of the recent hotel and motel inspection campaign, the CCSDFD is set to 
focus on restaurant fire safety and inspection efforts.  Restaurant owners participated in an 
informational meeting held at the fire station on November 2nd covering fire and life safety issues, 
and details for upcoming inspections.  The 30 local restaurants will be inspected by fire crews 
between now and February 2011. 
 
 “Change Your Clock – Change Your Battery” Did you remember to change the batteries in your 
smoke detectors when you changed your clock back from daylight savings time?  If you need 
assistance changing your batteries or if you need smoke detectors please contact the CCSDFD for 
assistance:  927-6240. 
 
 
 

“Fire Prevention is a Community Responsibility!” 
 

 

23



CMB Fire Monthly Stats:  Incidents

Categories Jan '10 Feb '10 Mar '10 Apr '10 May '10 June '10 July '10 Aug '10 Sept '10 Oct '10 Nov '10 Dec '10  Totals

Fire 0 2 1 0 2 2 3 5 1 0 16

Hazardous Mat. 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Medical* 40 37 40 36 47 27 37 45 35 34 378

Vehicle TC 2 0 2 4 2 3 1 2 5 1 22

Hazardous Situations 50 2 5 4 1 1 1 1 0 0 65

Public Service Assist 8 7 2 4 11 3 6 6 6 2 55

False Alarms 8 3 2 3 3 8 5 9 9 4 54

Agency Assist 0 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 0 2

Mutual Aid 0 0 0 1 0 0 0 0 5 1 7

Auto Aid 0 1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 1

Rescue 0 0 0 0 0 1 0 1 4 1 7

Fire Investigations 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Monthly Response Totals 108 52 52 52 66 45 54 0 69 66 43 0 607

Cumulative Totals 108 160 212 264 330 375 429 429 498 564 607 607

24



CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 6.B. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
  Bob Gresens, District Engineer 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010   Subject: DESALINATION AND  
          WATER STORAGE  
          FACILITIES REPORT 
 
DESALINATION PROJECT 
 
The Army Corps did not receive a right-of-entry permit from State Parks to conduct their 
investigation of the main paleochannel area after it was disclosed that the recreational beach 
area may also be part of the natural preserve area (which was previously assumed to be 
inland from the beach).  The Corps is currently considering alternative means to address 
concerns expressed by State Parks, which include the prohibition over the use of motorized 
vehicles, and possibly the removal of a core sample.  Because the earlier May 13, 2010 
Coastal Consistency Determination hearing required the Corps data collection activities to be 
completed prior to October 31, 2010, and the location of the natural preserve boundary was 
unknown during earlier CCD hearing, a new permitting effort is now required by the Corps to 
complete their study.  The Corps plans to complete a report on their investigation following 
collection and analysis of data obtained from the main paleochannel area.  
 
The Corps consultant, CDM, has begun preliminary efforts that will lead to the definition of 
various project alternatives for further assessment within a project-level EIR/EIS environmental 
clearance process.  Besides CDM, the Corps has contracted with the Chambers Group for 
purposes of completing the project-level EIR/EIS.  The two contractors will be working closely 
together during the development of alternatives to further identify potential environmental 
concerns along with means for avoiding or minimizing potential impacts.  The pending 
geotechnical data from the main Santa Rosa Creek paleochannel will be used in assessing the 
feasibility of a subterranean intake within that paleochannel, which may also be used to further 
define such an alternative within the project-level EIR/EIS.      
 
STUART STREET TANK AND RODEO GROUNDS PUMP STATION PROJECT 
INITIAL STUDIES/MITIGATED NEGATIVE DECLARATIONS 
 
Staff has been working on updating the IS/MNDs with RBF Consultants to incorporate changes 
in the project descriptions associated with an alternative that will include moving the smaller 
Stuart Street tank to the Fiscalini, as well as additional pipeline details.  Once completed, two 
IS/MNDs will be released for public review in conformance with the California Environmental 
Quality Act (CEQA).   The public review process is anticipated to occur within the next two to 
three months.  
 
 
 

25



26



27



28



29



30



31



 

 
 
 

CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
P.O. Box 65 • Cambria, CA  93428  • Telephone:  (805) 927-6223 • Fax: (805) 927-5584 

 
 
 
 
 
 

ADDENDA TO MONTHLY EXPENDITURE REPORT 
 
 
 

DEPARTMENT CODES 
      FD  Fire Department  

 F&R  Facilities and Resources   

 ADM  Administration  
 RC  Resource Conservation  
 WD  Water Department  
 WW  Wastewater Department  
 PR  Parks & Recreation  

 

32



 

CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
BOARD OF DIRECTORS REGULAR MEETING MINUTES 

WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER 10, 2010, 12:30 PM 
 

AGENDA ITEM DISCUSSION OR ACTION 
1A. CALL TO ORDER President Sanders called the meeting to order at 

12:35 PM 
1B. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE President Sanders led the pledge of allegiance. 
1C. ESTABLISHMENT OF QUORUM Vice President  Clift  Present 

Director Chaldecott  Present 
Director De Micco  Present 
Director MacKinnon  Present 
President Sanders  Present 
 
Staff Present: General Manager Tammy Rudock, 
District Counsel Tim Carmel, District Engineer Bob 
Gresens, District Clerk Kathy Choate 

1D. REPORT FROM CLOSED SESSION Counsel reported Board discussed Land Watch 2 
litigation and no report. 

2. SPECIAL REPORTS  
A. Sheriff’s Department Report None. 

3. ACKNOWLEDGEMENTS/PRESENTATIONS Maxine Lewis Memorial Shelter for the Homeless 
presentation by Richard Margetson. 
Proclamations honoring President Sanders and 
Director Chaldecott were presented. Accolades by 
other Board members followed. 
Public Comment:  
Ron Crummitt, Cambria. Commended Directors 
Chaldecott and Sanders.  
Michael Thompson, Cambria. Thanked Directors 
Sanders and Chaldecott for their service and 
thanked those who voted for him in recent 
election. 
A reception followed. 
 

4. AGENDA REVIEW Stands as published. 
5. PUBLIC COMMENT FOR ITEMS NOT ON 
 THE AGENDA 

JoEllen Butler, Cambria. Thanked Directors 
Chaldecott and Sanders. Invited Directors and 
audience to Hands Across the Ranch event on Nov 
13 and Nov 29 Tree Planting. 
Ron Bates, Cambria. Encouraged Board’s efforts to 
bring solution to water shortage.  
Vance Hyde, Cambria. Read Nov 9 Valerie Bentz 
statement for record and submitted written copy. 
Harry Farmer, Cambria. Commented on 
environmental issues regarding desal and election 
results. 

33



CCSD Minutes 
Page 2 
November 10, 2010 

Amanda Rice, Cambria. Thanked Directors 
Chaldecott and Sanders. Stated number of 
moratorium days and requested need for Water 
Code Section 350 hearing. 
 

6. MANAGER’S AND BOARD REPORTS  
A. GENERAL MANAGER’S REPORT General Manager Rudock presented Manager’s 

report.  
  

B. DESALINATION AND WATER STORAGE 
FACILITIES REPORT 

General Manager Rudock presented staff report. 
Bob Gresens reported on status of geotechnical 
investigations. Board discussion followed. 
 

C. MEMBER AND COMMITTEE REPORTS Director Clift reported compensation report 
disclosure will be highlighted in CSDA newsletter 
next month. 

7. CONSENT AGENDA General Manager Rudock read for the record 
consent agenda Items A – C. 
Director De Micco moved to approve the consent 
agenda as read into the record. Director 
MacKinnon seconded. Motion carried 
unanimously. Ayes -5, Noes – 0, Absent - 0 
Public Comment: None 
 

A. Approve Expenditures for Month of 
October 2010 

 

B. Approve Minutes of Board of Directors 
Meeting, October 28, 2010 

 

C. Adopt Resolution 58-2010 authorizing 
revisions to agreement between CCSD and 
Brad Clark 

 

8. HEARINGS AND APPEALS None 
9. REGULAR BUSINESS  

A. Adopt Resolution 59-2010 authorizing 
extended payment plan for the 
Cambria Tennis Club to repay its 
secondary promissory note with the 
CCSD 

President Sanders introduced the item. General 
Manager Rudock presented the staff report. 
Director Clift moved to adopt Resolution 59-2010 
approving a 10-year payment plan for the 
Cambria Tennis Club to repay the secondary 
promissory note, with annual payments in the 
amount of $505.30. Director Chaldecott 
seconded. Motion carried unanimously.  
Ayes – 5, Noes – 0, Absent – 0 

B. Adopt 2011 CCSD regular board 
meeting schedule. 

General Manager Rudock reviewed the staff 
report. Director MacKinnon moved to adopt the 
2011 regular Board meeting schedule. Vice 
President Clift seconded. Motion carried 
unanimously. Ayes – 5, Noes – 0, Absent - 0 

34



CCSD Minutes 
Page 2 
November 10, 2010 

C. Presentation (Part 3): Supplemental 
Long-Term Water Supply Project Cost 
Estimates and Financing Options 

General Manager Rudock introduced the 
presentation. District Engineer Gresens provided a 
PowerPoint on financing options. Board discussion 
followed.  
Public Comment: 
Amanda Rice, Cambria. Commented on energy 
costs to maintain a desalination facility. 

D. Adopt Resolution 61-2010 and 
introduction of Ordinance 02-2010 
adopting and amending the 2010 
edition of the California Fire Code, the 
2010 Edition of the International 
Wildland Urban Interface Code and 
National Fire Protection Association 
Standard 1144 

General Manager Rudock introduced the staff 
report and cited minor edits. Chief Miller received 
Board member revisions. 
Director De Micco moved to adopt Resolution 61-
2010 establishing Special Fire Code and Fire 
Sprinkler Findings of the CCSD and directed staff 
to submit Resolution 61-2010 and all appropriate 
and required documentation to the County of San 
Luis Obispo, and, once ratified by the Board of 
Supervisors for ratification and forward same to 
the California State Buildings and Standards 
Commission, as required by the California Health 
and Safety Code Section 13869.7. Vice President 
Clift seconded. Motion carried unanimously.  
Ayes – 5, Noes – 0, Absent – 0 
Comment: 
Amanda Rice, Cambria. Expressed appreciation for 
time spent reviewing and editing. 
President Sanders read title of Ordinance 02-2010. 
Director De Micco moved to adopt Ordinance 02-
2010 by title only and waive full reading and to 
schedule the public hearing for the December 13 
regular Board meeting to consider adoption of 
Ordinance 02-2010. Motion carried unanimously. 
Ayes – 5, Noes – 0, Absent - 0 
  

10. PUBLIC COMMENT Harry Farmer, Cambria. Commented on Nature 
Preserve and State Parks relationship with CCSD. 
Commented on KTEA radio spots for his campaign. 
Amanda Rice, Cambria. Reported on Marin’s 
Measure T regarding desal.  

11. ADJOURN President Sanders adjourned the meeting at 4:15 
PM. 

 

35



CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 7.C. 
       
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
  Alleyne LaBossiere, Finance Manager 
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010  Subject: Consider Adoption of 
         Resolution 62 -2010   
         Authorizing Banking Powers  
 
RECOMMENDATIONS: 
 
Adopt Resolution 62-2010 authorizing banking powers to CCSD Directors and Staff. 
 
 
FISCAL IMPACT:  
 
None. 
 
 
DISCUSSION:  
 
Heritage Oaks Bank and Rabobank require an approved resolution signifying who has been 
assigned banking powers. This serves to update the assigned banking powers due to CCSD 
Director and Staff changes, in accordance with established policy. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Attachments:  CCSD Roster of Banking Power Assignments 

Resolution 62-2010 
    
 
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
 
UNANIMOUS:   __CLIFT___ DEMICCO ___ MACKINNON ___ THOMPSON ____BAHRINGER___ 

36



RESOLUTION 62-2010 
 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 
OF THE CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 

APPROVING ASSIGNMENT OF BANKING POWERS FOR THE  
CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT’S BANK 

AND INVESTMENT ACCOUNTS 
  
WHEREAS, the CCSD has bank accounts at Heritage Oaks Bank; and 
 
WHEREAS, per recent Board approval, the CCSD will establish an account at 
Rabobank; and 
 
WHEREAS, Heritage Oaks Bank and Rabobank require an approved resolution 
stating which banking powers are assigned to CCSD officials and staff.  
 
THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, by the Board of Directors of the Cambria 
Community Services District that the banking powers are granted as listed within 
the attached Exhibit “A,” superseding Resolution 22-2009, dated May 28, 2009; 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED this 13th day of December 2010. 
 
 
            
       __________________________ 
       President, Board of Directors 
 
  
 ATTEST:     APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
        
 Kathy A. Choate    Timothy J. Carmel 
 District Clerk     District Counsel 
 

37



 

           Page 1 of 2 
 

CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
EXHIBIT “A” TO RESOLUTION 62-2010 

DECEMBER 13, 2010 
AUTHORIZED BANKING POWERS 

 
AGENTS 
NAME AND TITLE OR POSITION 
 
A Muril Clift, Director 
B Frank DeMicco, Director 
C Allan MacKinnon, Director 
D Michael Thompson, Director 
E James Bahringer, Director 
F Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
G Jerry Gruber, Utilities Manager 
H Alleyne LaBossiere, Finance Manager 
I Robert Gresens, District Engineer 
J Kathy Choate, District Clerk 
K Kathy Fry, Conf. Administrative Technician III 
L Monique Madrid, Conf. Administrative Technician III 
M Cortney Upthegrove, Administrative Technician II 
N Cori Ryan, Administrative Technician III 
 
 
 
 
Holder of  Description of Power        No. of Signatures 
  Power          Required 
 
None   All Powers Listed.           N/A 
 

F,G   Open any deposit or share account(s) in the name of the CCSD.         2 
 

A,B,C,D,E,F,G,I,J Endorse Checks and orders for the payment of money or to           2 
   Otherwise withdraw or transfer funds on deposit. 
 

F,G Borrow Money on behalf and in the name of the CCSD, sign, execute          2  
                                     and deliver promissory notes or other evidence of indebtedness. 
 

F,G Enter into a written lease for the purpose of renting, maintaining,           2 
   Accessing and terminating a Safe Deposit Box. 
 

A,B,C,D,E,F,G Endorse, assign, transfer, mortgage or pledge bills receivable, warehouse        2 
 receipts, bills of lading, stocks, bonds, real estate or other property now or  

hereafter owned or acquired by the CCSD as security for sums borrowed, 
 and to discount the same, unconditionally guarantee the payment of all bills 
 received, negotiated or discounted and to waive demand, presentment,  

protest, notice of protest and notice of non-payment. 
 

 

           

38



 

           Page 2 of 2 
 
 
 
 

Holder of  Description of Power        No. of Signatures 
  Power          Required 
 
F,H,J   Transfer LAIF funds into/out of CCSD bank accounts.        N/A  
 

F,G,H,J,K  Issue stop-payment of checks and order for payment of money        N/A 
   and like activities. 
 

F,G,H,J,K,L,M,N Make account inquires and deposits.          N/A 
 

F,G,H,J,K,L,M,N Pick up bank statements.               1 
 

F,G,H,J,K,L,M,N Recurring electronic payment of federal and California payroll taxes.       N/A 
 
 

F,G,H,J,K,L,M,N Recurring electronic payroll direct deposits.           N/A 
 

F,G,H,J,K,L,M,N Recurring electronic deposits into CCSD accounts.         N/A 
 

F,H,J,K  Recurring electronic transfers between CCSD accounts.        N/A 
 

F,H,J,K  Recurring manual transfers between CCSD accounts.                    1 
 
    

39



CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 7.D. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
  Alleyne LaBossiere, Finance Manager  
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010  Subject: Consider Resolution 63-2010  
         Authorizing the Establishment of 
         a Non-Interest Bearing Account  
         at Heritage Oaks Bank 
 
RECOMMENDATION:   
 
Adopt Resolution 63-2010 authorizing the establishment of a CCSD non-interest bearing bank 
account at Heritage Oaks Bank (HOB). 
 
FISCAL IMPACT: 
 
There are no costs associated with the opening of an account except for staff time.  While 
there may be a minimal decrease in potential interest revenue, it is offset by substantial 
increased safety of CCSD funds on deposit, which corresponds to the first priority of the 
CCSD’s Investment Policy. 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 
At the October 28, 2010 CCSD Board of Directors meeting, the Board approved opening an 
overflow bank account at Rabobank.  The reason for this was to maximize the FDIC coverage 
of the CCSD’s funds while large deposits cleared the bank, after which the funds can be 
transferred to LAIF.  On or about November 10, 2010, the FDIC changed their rules to 
implement a new federal law.  The new rules allow for funds belonging to a public agency, 
such as the CCSD, to be covered by the FDIC regardless of the amount on deposit.   
 
This new legislation removes the reason for opening the overflow at a bank other than HOB.  
No matter what amount is on deposit in interest bearing accounts at HOB, any amount on 
deposit in the newly established non-interest bearing overflow account will be covered by the 
FDIC.  If the overflow account were opened at Rabobank in a money market account as was 
approved by the CCSD Board of Directors, any amount over $250,000 would not be covered 
by the FDIC.  Such uncovered amounts were projected to be as much as $300,000.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

40



Since the CCSD already does business at HOB and is very satisfied with its banking 
relationship, and due to its convenient location next door to the CCSD administration office, 
having the overflow account there would is most efficient for business purposes.  If $500,000 
were deposited in a Rabobank money market account, less than $35 of interest would be 
earned in the four (4) days expected for the funds to be cleared.  It is projected that the 
potential lost interest would be under $100 over an entire fiscal year.  As the Finance Manager 
earlier reported, staff will continue to monitor and consider external investments in interest-
bearing accounts.  Currently, a Rabobank money market account in the amount of $250,000 
gains 0.15% higher interest than is offered by LAIF, which would result in an increase in 
interest of approximately $375 over a year’s time. 
 
 
 
 
Attachment: Resolution 63-2010  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
  
UNANIMOUS:   ___ CLIFT ___ DE MICCO ___ MACKINNON ___THOMPSON ___BAHRINGER 

41



 
RESOLUTION 63-2010 

 
A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

OF THE CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
AUTHORIZING THE ESTABLISHMENT OF A NON-INTEREST BEARING 

BANKING ACCOUNT AT HERITAGE OAKS BANK 
 

WHEREAS, the Cambria Community Services District’s Investment Policy’s prime objective is 
the safety of the CCSD’s funds; and 
 
WHEREAS, the safest investment is considered to be a bank account insured by the Federal 
Deposit Insurance Corporation (FDIC); and 
 
WHEREAS, there are situations that cause the CCSD to have more funds on deposit in 
interest bearing bank accounts than is covered by the FDIC; and 
 
WHEREAS, there will be very minimal negative fiscal impact related to maintaining an overflow 
bank account at Heritage Oaks Bank offset by increased safety and efficiency. 
 
THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Directors for the Cambria Community 
Services District that a non-interest bearing banking account be established at Heritage Oaks 
Bank for overflow funds. 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED this 13th day of December 2010. 
 
 
 
      _______________________________ 
      President, Board of Directors 

 
 
ATTEST:     APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
Kathy A. Choate    Timothy J. Carmel 
District Clerk     District Counsel 

42



CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 7.E. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
  Alleyne LaBossiere, Finance Manager  
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010  Subject: Consider Resolution 64-2010  
         Approving Special Depository                             
                   Agreement with Heritage    
                                                                                                 Oaks Bank 
 
RECOMMENDATION:   
 
Adopt Resolution 64-2010 approving a special depository agreement with Heritage Oaks Bank 
(HOB) for after-hours deposits. 
 
FISCAL IMPACT: 
 
While there is a potential $7.00 charge for a lost key, HOB informed the CCSD that this would 
be waived if the situation arises.  All other fees will be waived as has been HOB’s past 
practice. 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 
The special depository agreement with Heritage Oaks Bank will allow the CCSD to make bank 
deposits after regular banking hours as well as at other times that the bank is closed.  In order 
to obtain a key for making after-hours deposits, HOB requires a Board approved resolution.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Attachment: Resolution 64-2010  
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
  
UNANIMOUS:   ___ CLIFT ___ DE MICCO ___ MACKINNON ___ THOMPSON___BAHRINGER 

43



 
RESOLUTION 64-2010 

 
A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 

OF THE CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
APPROVING A SPECIAL DEPOSITORY AGREEMENT 

WITH HERITAGE OAKS BANK 
 

WHEREAS, the ability to make after-hours deposits would benefit the Cambria Community 
Services District; and 
 
WHEREAS, Heritage Oaks Bank requires a Board of Directors’ resolution to implement the 
required Special Depository Agreement; and 
 
WHEREAS, there will be no fiscal impact related to the Special Depository Agreement with 
Heritage Oaks Bank. 
 
THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Directors for the Cambria Community 
Services District that the Special Depository Agreement be authorized. 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED this 13th day of December 2010. 
 
 
 
 
 
      _______________________________ 
      President, Board of Directors 

 
 
ATTEST:     APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
 
Kathy A. Choate    Timothy J. Carmel 
District Clerk     District Counsel 

44



CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 7.F. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
  Kathy Choate, District Clerk 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: February 25, 2010  Subject:  Cast Ballot Voting for Muril Clift as  
        Special District Member to Local Agency 
        Formation Commission (LAFCO) Term  
        Expiring December 2012 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
 
Cast ballot voting for CCSD Director Muril Clift as LAFCO (The Local Agency Formation 
Commission) Special District Member 
 
FISCAL IMPACT: 
 
None 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 
Three individuals have been nominated to fill the Special District member vacancy on the San 
Luis Obispo Local Agency Formation Commission (LAFCO). The term expires in December 
2010. The nominees are as follows: 
 
 Muril Clift, Cambria Community Services District 
 Brian Kreowski, Port San Luis Harbor District 
 Marshall Ochylski, Los Osos Community Services District 
 
The CCSD nominated Director Clift to fill the unexpired special district member term on the 
LAFCO at its November 10, 2010 regular meeting. Each independent special district may vote 
for one nominee. The completed ballot is to be returned to the LAFCO office no later than 
December 23, 2010. A copy of the ballot is attached for your information. 
 
 
Attachment: November 18, 2010 LAFCO Ballot for LAFCO Special District Member 
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
 
UNANIMOUS:   ___ CLIFT ___ BAHRINGER ___ DE MICCO ___ MACKINNON ___THOMPSON ___ 
 

45



TO:   EACH INDEPENDENT SPECIAL DISTRICT 

FROM:  DAVID CHURCH, EXECUTIVE OFFICER 

DATE:  NOVEMBER 18, 2010 DUE DATE:  DECEMBER 23, 2010 

SUBJECT:  BALLOT FOR LAFCO SPECIAL DISTRICT MEMBER 

Three individuals have been nominated to fill the unexpired term of Special District 
Member David Brooks (TCSD) on the San Luis Obispo Local Agency Formation 
Commission (LAFCO).  This term expires in December 2012.  The nominees are: 
 

  Muril Clift, Cambria CSD 

  Brian Kreowski, Port San Luis Harbor District 

  Marshall Ochylski, Los Osos CSD 

 
Date of Action: __________________________ 
 
The Government Code (56332 (c)(1)) states that “at the end of the nomination period, 
the Executive Officer shall prepare and deliver, or send by certified mail, to each 
independent special district one ballot and voting instructions.”  The Government Code 
also allows for the ballot and instructions to be sent electronically if the special district 
selection committee agrees and written evidence of receipt of the ballot and instructions 
is retained by the executive officer. At the CSDA chapter meeting on September 17, 
2010 the District’s agreed that completing the election electronically would be 
appropriate.   
 
Ballot Instructions. Each Independent Special District may vote for one nominee. The 
vote by a District must be considered by the District’s Board of Directors as an item on 
its agenda. Please schedule this matter for a vote at your Board of Directors meeting as 
soon as possible.  The District’s selection should be returned to the LAFCO office no 
later than December 23, 2010 via one of the following ways: 1) An email indicating 
the date the item was on the Board’s agenda and the selected nominee, 2) A 
scanned pdf of this ballot attached to an email with one of the nominees selected 
and the date it was considered on the Board’s agenda, or 3) A fax sent to LAFCO 
with one of the nominees selected and the agenda date of the Board’s decision. 
 
Please contact me at 781-5795 or Dchurch@slolafco.com if you have any questions. 
 
David Church, AICP 
Executive Officer 
San Luis Obispo LAFCO 
805.788.2096 
 
 

46

mailto:Dchurch@slolafco.com


CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 7.G. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
  Kathy Choate, District Clerk 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010 Subject: Consider Nomination of Muril Clift as  
        Special District Member to the SLO  
        County Integrated Waste  
        Management Authority (IWMA) 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
 
Nominate CCSD Vice President Muril Clift to serve as the Special District Member on the San 
Luis Obispo County IWMA. 
 
FISCAL IMPACT:   
 
None. 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 
The SLO County IWMA is requesting nominations to the IWMA Board of Directors to replace 
David Brooks, former Templeton CSD Director who did not seek re-election this past 
November.  The SLO County IWMA manages recycling and the disposal of solid and 
hazardous wastes within the County.  Ten authorized special districts are part of the SLO 
County IWMA (listed in the attached email notice).  Nominations are to be submitted in writing 
no later than December 31, 2010.  At the end of the nomination period, each special district 
will receive a ballot and voting instructions. 
 
Vice President Clift has expressed an interest in filling the vacancy.  
 
 
Attachment: November 23, 2010 Request for Nominations  
 
 
 
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
 
UNANIMOUS:   ___ CLIFT ___ DE MICCO ___ MAC KINNON___ THOMPSON___ BAHRINGER___ 

47



48



49



CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 8.A. 
       
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
  Mark Miller, Fire Chief 
-----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010  Subject: Consider Adoption of Resolution  
        61-2010 and Introduction of Ordinance 
        02-2010 Adopting and Amending the  
        2010 Edition of the California Fire Code, 
        the 2009 Edition of the International  
        Wildland Urban Interface Code and 
        National Fire Protection Association  
        Standard 1144   
 
RECOMMENDATIONS: 

1. Receive staff report for Ordinance 02-2010 amending CCSD Code Chapter 6.04 and 
adopting and amending the 2010 edition of the California Fire Code and 2009 Edition of the 
International Wildland Urban Interface Code and the National Fire Protection Association 
Standard 1144. 

2. Open the public hearing. 
3. Receive public input. 
4. Close public hearing. 
5. Adopt ordinance 02-2010 adopting and amending the 2010 edition of the California Fire 

Code, the 2009 edition of the International Wildland Urban Interface Code and the National 
Fire Protection Association Standard 1144. 

6. Direct CCSD staff to submit Resolution 61-2010 and all appropriate and required 
documentation to the County of San Luis Obispo, and, once ratified by the Board of 
Supervisors, forward same to the California State Buildings and Standards Commission, as 
required by the California Health and Safety Code Section 13869.7. 

 
FISCAL IMPACT:    
 
$40 for the purchase of a printable 2009 Edition of the International Wildland Urban Interface Code, 
staff time, District Counsel time, and costs required to update the CCSD Municipal Code.  
 
BACKGROUND: 
 
The local amendment package for 2010 code adoption cycle includes no new additions from the 
previous (2007) adoption and existing fire code.  There are however, a number of deletions to the 
previous local amendment package.  The following is a bulleted summary of the amendments that 
were dropped, reducing the number of amendments from 41 to the 18 included in the current 
document.   
 

• CFC Section 104.1 eliminates granting Peace Officer authority to CCSDFD Firefighters 
• CFC Section 109.3 eliminates CCSD determination of citation and fine amounts 

50



• CFC Section 308.3.1 eliminates provision for open flame cooking devices to have vertical 
chimneys and spark arrestors. 

• CFC Section 311.1 eliminates the language “buildings or structures damaged by fire or any 
other type of disaster” from existing section. 

• CFC Section 503.1.1 eliminates amendment to required driveway widths. 
• CFC Section 502.2.4 eliminates exception for sprinklers from roadway turning radius 

requirements. 
• CFC Section 503.2.7 eliminates roadway requirements for fire department access in 

reference to grade. – The standard code language is adequate. 
• CFC Section 503.5.1 eliminates the sole use of Knox Company products for security gate 

access. 
• CFC Section 505.1 eliminates requirement for commercial property to use 6” numbering for 

addressing.  Unnecessary – the CFC requires 4” numbering. 
• CFC Section 506.1 eliminates the requirement for Knox Company only products to be used 

for locked barriers. 
• CFC Section 506.1.1  eliminates Knox Company requirement again - redundant  
• CFC Section 508.5.5 eliminates requirement for 5 feet of clear space around hydrants and 

uses CFC requirement of 3 feet. 
• CFC Section 510.1 eliminates requirement to specially identify fire department connections. 
• CFC Section 901.7 eliminates the language referencing operating procedures during fire 

watch duty. This is unnecessary and is contained in fire department SOGs. 
• CFC Section 903.2 eliminates the requirement for a sprinkler head at the top of elevator 

shafts if fire rated enclosure.  This is a SLO County adopted code change. 
• CFC Section 903.4 eliminates special requirements for sprinkler system monitoring and 

alarms.  The existing CFC language is adequate. 
• CFC Section 904.11.4 eliminates the requirement for outdoor barbeque grills to be 

sprinklered. 
• CFC Section 906.2 eliminates portable fire extinguisher language.  This is already covered 

in the CFC. 
• CFC Section 912.2.2 eliminates the requirement for signage on fire department 

connections. 
• CFC Section 3204.3.1.1 eliminates the ban of cryogenic fluid containers. 
• CFC Section 4701 eliminates language referencing wildland urban interface requirements 

which are covered in the current code. 
• CFC Section 4710.1.2 eliminates redundant language requiring Class A roofs or Class A 

roof assemblies which is already addressed in IWUIC Chapter 5. 
• CFC Appendix B eliminates reference to fire flow requirement already covered in CFC. 
• CFC Appendix D eliminates requirement for signage on fire department access roads. 
• IWUIC Chapter 4 Section 402.2.2 eliminates requirement for adequate water supply – 

current sprinkler requirements make this amendment redundant. 
 

DISCUSSION: 
 
At the November 10, 2010 regular Board meeting, Ordinance 02-2010 was introduced and 
unanimously approved by CCSD Board of Directors. The Board adopted Resolution 61-2010 with 
Findings repealing and replacing Resolution 54-2010. Ordinance 02-2010 will repeal and replace 
CCSD Ordinance 03-2007.  

51



 
With the adoption of this ordinance, the CCSD will comply with the California Health and Safety 
Code, and enforce Resolution 54-2010, a more stringent Fire and Life Safety requirements, than 
contained in the 2010 California Fire Code. The State of California will implement the California 
Fire Code 2010 edition, on January 1, 2011.  
 
Resolution 61-2010 (the “Resolution”), establishes, identifies, and addresses the required Health 
and Safety Code to establish more restrictive Fire and Life Safety codes and standards than 
contained in the State’s Fire Code. This is necessary for the protection of human life, the 
environment and property of the residents and visitors to Cambria. The purpose for adopting the 
2010 California Fire Code, the 2009 edition of the International Wildland Urban Interface Code, and 
the National Fire Protection Association Standard 1144- Protection of Life and Property from 
Wildfire, including appendices, annual supplements, State amendments, local amendments and 
errata is that these uniform codes complement each other. Some sections of one code are 
relatively silent to certain applications while other codes properly address the application. 
 
This same process is being done in many other special districts, cities and counties throughout 
California. The proposed amendments to these uniform codes focus on the many unique 
environmental, topographical, geological, climatic and emergency response issues that face the 
Cambria Community Services District. The proposed amendments addressed critical fire sprinkler 
requirements and fire safety issues specific to Cambria. 
 
Staff recommends that with adoption of Ordinance 02-2010 the Board of Directors direct staff to 
submit fully conformed Ordinance 02-2010 and all appropriate and required documentation to the 
County of San Luis Obispo, and, once ratified by the Board of Supervisors, forward same to the 
California State Buildings and Standards Commission, as required by the California Health and 
Safety Code Section 13869.7. 
 
The CCSD submission would be in advance of the State’s adoption of the 2010 California Fire 
Code, and meet the adoption and amendment requirements. Upon filing with the State, the new 
regulations and standards would be fully enforceable within the CCSD. 
 
Attachments:  Ordinance 02-2010 
   Resolution 61-2010 
   “Attachment 2” Fire Code and Fire Sprinkler Findings 
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
 
UNANIMOUS:  ___ CLIFT ___ BAHRINGER____ DE MICCO ___ MAC KINNON___ THOMPSON___ 

52



 
 

ORDINANCE 02-2010 
December 13, 2010 

 
ORDINANCE OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS  

OF THE CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
ADOPTING AND AMENDING THE 2010 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 

AND 2009 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE 
CODE AND THE NATIONAL FIRE PROTECTION ASSOCIATION STANDARD 1144  

 
BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF THE CAMBRIA 
COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT AS FOLLOWS: 
 
Section 1. FINDINGS. 
 
The Board of Directors of the Cambria Community Services District, (hereinafter  
referred to as “District”), hereby makes the following findings of facts: 
 

A. Section 13869 of the Health and Safety Code of the State of California, and 
Article 2 (commencing with section 50022) of Chapter 1 of Part 1 of Division 
1 of Title 5 of the Government Code, and 61100 (d) of the Government 
Code, Authorize the District to adopt an ordinance, which incorporates by 
reference fire prevention codes, and amendments. 
 

B. The California Code of Regulations/CA Buildings and Standards Code, Title 
24, Part 9 which includes the California Fire Code, is adopted by order of the 
California Legislature with supplements published in intervening years. 
 

C. The latest edition of the California Buildings and Standards Code was 
published this year and will have the force of law beginning January 1, 2011 
and any local additions, amendments, and deletions authorized by law must 
be incorporated by that time. 

 
D. This Ordinance will repeal and replace the current fire codes and all other 

previously adopted fire codes and amendments. This Ordinance will adopt 
and amend the 2010 California Fire Code, which is based on the 2009 
International Fire Code, the 2009 International Wildland Urban Interface 
Code as published by the International Code Council, and the National Fire 
Protection Association Standard 1144 for Reducing Structure Ignition 
Hazards from Wildland Fire, and will include annual supplements and State 
amendments and errata, and adopt the special findings of fact.  

 
E. Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code Sections 13869.7, 17958.7, 

and 18941.5 the Board adopted Resolution 61-2010 making specific 
findings, that because of climatic, geological, and topographical conditions 
that exist in Cambria, that the amendments to the adopted codes are 
necessary to protect the citizens life, health, property and the environment.  

 
Section 2.  Amendment to Section 6.04.010 of the Cambria Community Services 

District Municipal Code 
 
Section 6.04.010 of the Cambria Community Services District Municipal Code is 
hereby amended as follows: 

 

53



 
Adoption of the 2010 edition of the California Fire Code, the 2009 International 
Wildland Urban Interface Code and National Fire Protection Association Standard 
1144. 
 
Except as provided in Section 6.04.040, all Articles and Appendices of the 2010 
California Fire Code, which is based on the 2009 edition of the International Fire Code 
as published by the International Code Council, the 2009 edition of the International 
Wildland Urban Interface Code as published by the International Code Council and the 
2008 edition of Standard 1144 Standard For Reducing Structure Ignition Hazards From 
Wildland Fire as published by the National Fire Protection Association are adopted, 
including annual supplements, State amendments and errata. 
 
Section 3. Amendment to Section 6.04.020 of the Cambria Community Services 
District Municipal Code 
 
Section 6.04.020 of the Cambria Community Services District Municipal Code is 
hereby amended as follows: 
 
 
Establishment and Duties of the Fire Prevention Bureau. 
 
1. The California Fire Code and all adopted fire prevention and life safety codes shall 

be enforced by the Cambria CSD Fire Department, operated under the supervision 
of the Chief of the Fire Department. 

2. The Bureau of Fire Prevention is established and shall be operated under the 
supervision of the Fire Chief. The District Manager shall appoint the Fire Chief 
based on qualifications to perform those duties. 

3. The Fire Chief may designate such members of the Fire Department as inspectors 
from time-to-time as necessary. 

 
Section 4. Amendment to Section 6.04.030 of the Cambria Community Services 
District Municipal Code 
 
Section 6.04.030 of the Cambria Community Services District Municipal Code is 
hereby amended as follows:  
 
Definitions 
 
The following definitions shall be used in interpreting the California Fire Code and all 
applicable code standards, and to the extent that the following definitions are in conflict 
with any definitions contained in either code or applicable code standards, the following 
definitions shall prevail and be used. 
 
1. Whenever the word “fire code official” is used in the California Fire Code, it shall 

mean the Cambria Community Services District Fire Department, herein after 
referred to as the Cambria CSD Fire Department. 

 
Section 5. Amendment to Section 6.04.040 of the Cambria Community Services 
District Municipal Code 
 
Section 6.04.040 of the Cambria Community Services District Municipal Code is 
hereby amended as follows: 
 
Amendments and Exceptions to the 2010 California Fire Code. 
 
Pursuant to Resolution No. 61-2010, the Board of Directors of the Cambria Community 

54



Services District has found that because certain local climatic, geological and 
topographical conditions exist within the District, more stringent building standards 
relating to fire and public safety than those standards adopted by the State Fire 
Marshal, and contained in the California Building Standards Code are necessary for fire 
protection within the District. Resolution No. 61-2010 and the findings contained therein 
are hereby incorporated by this reference. The following amendments and exceptions to 
the California Fire Code, 2010 edition, are therefore hereby made: 
 
1. CFC Section 101.1 Title: Insert the Cambria Community Services District. 
 
2. CFC Section 108.1 Board of Appeals Established is amended as follows: To 

determine the suitability of alternate materials and types of construction and to 
provide for reasonable interpretations of the provisions of this code, there shall be 
and hereby is created a Board of Appeals consisting of the five members of the 
Cambria CSD Board of Directors. When a Cambria CSD Fire Code Appeal Board 
is convened, the Board of Directors shall become members of the Cambria CSD 
Fire Code Appeal Board. The existing rules and regulations of the Cambria CSD 
Board of Directors shall apply for appeal proceedings under this code. All decisions 
and findings will be placed into writing and a copy sent to the Fire Chief and the 
appellant. 

 
3. CFC Section 113.2 Fees is amended as follows: Fees are specified in the Cambria 

Community Services District Municipal Code, as contained in Chapter 3.04 Fee 
schedules for District Services. 

 
4. CFC Section 304.2 Combustible Waste material Storage is amended as follows: 

All rubbish or garbage containers that have an open top, combustible sides or lids, 
and or metal lids that are not tight fitting or closing must be located a minimum of 
10-feet away from any combustible siding, overhang, or any other combustible 
portion of a building or structure. 
1. Garbage or rubbish containers may be placed against a combustible surface or   

overhang provided it is protected by a domestic supply automatic sprinkler 
head, and the area that contains the container is so configured so the rubbish 
container will be positioned under the required automatic fire sprinkler head. 
This domestic automatic fire sprinkler head must have a shut-off valve that is 
identified and protected as well as an approved check-valve. The Cambria CSD 
Fire Department must approve all garbage or rubbish container automatic fire 
sprinkler systems. 

 
5. CFC Section 307.1.1 Prohibited Open Burning is amended as follows: All open 

burning, bonfires, warming fires, and debris fires are prohibited within the Cambria 
CSD jurisdictional boundaries, except as permitted and authorized by the Cambria 
Community Services District Fire Department and the San Luis Obispo County Air 
Pollution Control District. This amendment does not restrict barbecues in a 
permanent approved barbecue pit or a manufactured device designed for the 
purpose.   

 
6. CFC Section 503.2.3 Fire Department Access Surface is amended as follows: All 

fire apparatus access roads, must be able to support a minimum of 40,000 pounds 
as certified by a licensed civil engineer. 

 
7. CFC Section 503.2.4 Fire Department Access Turning Radius is amended as 

follows: The turning radius of a fire apparatus access road or driveway, shall be at 
least 28 feet inside radius and 48 feet outside radius. 

 
8. CFC Section 503.4 Obstruction and Control of Fire Apparatus Access is amended 

as follows: The Fire Chief and/or their authorized representatives, shall have the 

55



power and authority to remove or cause to be removed, without notice, any vehicle 
or object parked or placed in violation of the California Fire Code. The owner of the 
vehicle or other object removed is responsible for all towing, storage and other 
charges incurred. 

 
9. CFC Section 503.5 Required Gates or Barricades is amended as follows: All 

motorized gates or barricades must have a system disconnect and a clearly 
understandable manual method of opening. All locks or other security devices 
must be either a Knox Company product or another similar system as approved by 
the Cambria CSD Fire Department. 

 
10. CFC Section 603.4 Portable Un-Vented Heaters is amended as follows: Portable 

un-vented fuel-fired heating equipment shall be prohibited in all occupancies and in 
all groups. All flammable and combustible fueled heaters that are not vented to the 
outside of the building are included in this section. 

 
11. CFC Section 903.2 Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems Where Required is amended 

as follows: An automatic fire sprinkler system that meets or exceeds the California 
Building Code Standards, National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Standards 
and all other recognized standards as approved by the Cambria CSD Fire 
Department shall be installed as follows: 

 
1. All new buildings in all Groups except Group-R occupancies, which will be 

1000 square feet or larger, shall be protected by an automatic fire sprinkler 
system. The total floor area of such building shall be computed using the 
outside wall areas. The aggregate areas of a building may not be reduced, 
subdivided, or compartmentalized into areas less than 1000 square feet by the 
installation of separation walls. Covered patio areas or other common areas 
that are protected on three sides will be included in the total floor area. All new 
buildings that are mixed use occupancies are required to be entirely protected 
by a NFPA 13 compliant automatic fire sprinkler system regardless of square 
footage.  

2. All buildings in all Groups except Group-R buildings where a proposal to build 
an addition, perform an alteration or remodel where the total square footage 
will be 1000 square feet or larger and or where a third floor will be added or 
expanded, must be protected by an approved automatic fire sprinkler system. 
In addition all existing or remodeled buildings, which are or will include a 
mixed-use occupancy must be entirely protected by a NFPA 13 compliant 
automatic sprinkler system, if the building is expanded, regardless of square 
footage.  If any existing building in all Groups except Group-R is deemed to be 
more hazardous due to building construction, materials or equipment stored 
inside or the occupancy, or the occupancy type, the entire building must be 
protected by an approved NFPA automatic fire sprinkler system, as determined 
and approved by the Fire Chief or their designate. 

3. All new Group-R buildings and other accessory buildings including but not 
limited to attached or detached garages, granny units, guesthouses, studios or 
other residential units or buildings regardless of square footage must be 
protected by an automatic fire sprinkler system. (Storage sheds less than 120 
square feet are excluded. All buildings must be separated the minimum 
horizontal distance as required in the California Building Code or other 
applicable codes in order to qualify as a separate building. (In no case shall 
this separation distance be less than 10-feet.) 

4. All existing Group-R buildings that are altered or remodeled by adding 
additional interior floor area shall require the installation of an automatic fire 
sprinkler system if the building is 2499 square feet or larger, or will exceed 
2499 square feet after completion of the alteration. 

5. All existing Group-R buildings that are altered or remodeled through the 

56



issuance of a building permit, shall require the installation of an automatic fire 
sprinkler system under any of the following conditions: 
§ The building is located on a roadway that does not meet the California Fire 

Code, Wildland Urban Interface Code, or other applicable code standards 
for fire apparatus access; or, 

§ The building is located in a Very High/Extreme Fire Risk area as identified 
by the Cambria CSD Fire Department Fire Risk map; or,  

§ The building is located in an area served by a fire hydrant(s) that does not 
deliver a minimum 1500 gallons per minute fire flow; or, 

§ The building is located on property in such a manner that it is more than 
20-feet in elevation above or below an approved fire access roadway as 
defined in the California Fire Code. 

6. The installation of an automatic fire sprinkler system shall be required in all 
existing Group-R buildings when the building is proposed to add a third floor or 
third level, or an addition to existing square footage on a third floor. 

7. These requirements shall be followed, unless the California Fire Code or the 
Building Code is more restrictive, whereby the more restrictive standard shall 
apply. 

 
12. CFC Section 903.3.2 Quick Response and Residential Sprinkler locations, is 

amended to add subsection 4 as follows:  Where automatic sprinkler systems are 
required by this code, quick-response or residential automatic sprinklers shall be 
installed in the in the following areas in accordance with Section 903.3.1 and their 
listings as follows: 4. All Group-R residences must have an approved automatic fire 
sprinkler head(s) installed in all attic or other areas where a forced air unit (FAU) or 
other open flame or heat producing device is located.  An inspector’s test valve 
must also be installed on all Group-R buildings at the point furthest opposite from 
where the fire sprinkler riser enters the building.  Sprinkler heads and inspectors 
test valve locations are subject to approval by the Cambria CSD Fire Department. 

 
13. CFC Section 2206.2.3 Above Ground tanks located outside, above grade, is 

amended to add subsection 5 as follows:  
5. All above ground liquid motor fuel tanks regardless of class of liquid or size must 
be permitted and approved by the Fire Chief or their designate.  

 
14. CFC Section 3301 Explosives and Fireworks, is amended as follows: The 

discharge, possession and or storage of both Safe and Sane (California State Fire 
Marshal Approved) Fireworks as well as all illegal fireworks is prohibited, except for 
professional displays that are permitted and approved by the Fire Chief or their 
designate, in accordance with Title 19, California Code of Regulations, Chapter 6. 

 
15. CFC 3309 Seizure of Fireworks. The Fire Chief or their designate shall have the 

authority to seize, take and remove fireworks stored, sold, offered for sale, used or 
handled in violation of the provisions of Title 19, California Code of Regulations, 
Chapter 6 and the California Health and Safety Code, Chapter 9. This shall include 
Safe and Sane fireworks as well as those specified in amended Section 3301.  

 
16. IWUIC Chapter 5 Table 502.1 Fire Hazard Severity: This table is deleted and 

eliminated in its entirety. 
 
17. IWUIC Chapter 5 Special Building Construction Regulations, Section 505 Class-2 

Ignition Resistant Construction (505.2 only) and Section 506 Class-3 Ignition 
Resistant Construction (506.2 only) are amended as follows: Roof Covering. Roofs 
shall have either a Class-A roof covering or a Class-A roof assembly. For roof 
coverings where the profile allows a space between the roof coverings and roof 
decking, the space at the eave ends shall be fire-stopped to preclude entry of 
flames or embers. Partial roof replacements are not allowed. 

57



 
18. IWUIC Appendix-C (Fire Hazard Severity Form) is deleted and eliminated in its 

entirety and is replaced as follows: In order to determine the applicable Fire 
Hazard Severity Class rating for construction within the CCSD  the current 
Cambria CSD Fire Wildland Fire Risk map will be utilized to determine the 
requirements for the ignition resistant class rating. When there is a conflict 
between California State severity zones and Cambria CSD severity zone maps  
the more stringent requirement shall be applied.  

 
Section 6. Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances: 
 
All former ordinances or parts thereof conflicting or inconsistent with the provisions of 
this Ordinance are repealed. 
  
Section 7. Provisions of this Ordinance: 
 
If any provisions of this Ordinance are for any reason, held to be invalid by a court of 
competent jurisdiction, the Cambria CSD hereby declares that it would have passed 
each and every remaining provision irrespective of such holding order to accomplish the 
intent of this Ordinance. 
 
 
Section 8. Date of Effect: 
 
This Ordinance shall take effect and be in full force and effect from and after its 
adoption, publication as required by law, ratification by the San Luis Obispo County 
Board of Supervisors and filing with the California State Building and Standards 
Commission, as required by law.  Within fifteen (15) days of passage, this Ordinance 
shall be published one time in a newspaper of general circulation published within the 
Cambria Community Services District’s jurisdictional boundaries, together with the 
names of said Board Members voting for and against the Ordinance. 
 
On the motion of Director ___________, seconded by Director ______________, and  
the following roll call vote, to wit: 
 
 
AYES: 
NOES: 
ABSENT: 
 
ORDINANCE No. 02-2010 is adopted this __13___ day of __December_____ 2010__. 
 
 
 
             
       President, Board of Directors 
 
 
ATTEST:      APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
      
Kathy A. Choate     Timothy J. Carmel 
District Clerk      District Counsel  

58



59



60



 1

“ATTACHMENT 2” 
CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT FIRE DEPARTMENT 

 FIRE CODE AND FIRE SPRINKLER FINDINGS 
 
 
Pursuant to Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 of the California Health and Safety Code, the report 
contained herein shall be facts and the findings document to support proposed Cambria 
Community Services District Ordinance No.02-2010.  Under said ordinance, specific amendments 
have been established which are more restrictive in nature than those sections adopted by the State 
of California and contained in Title 24 and Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations. 
 
The amendments to the California Fire Code, 2010 Edition (which is based on the 2010 
International Fire Code as published by the International Code Council, and is part of the 
California Code of Regulations/ California Buildings and Standards Code, Title 24, Part 9), and 
the Wildland Urban Interface Code 2009 edition (as published by the International Code Council), 
and the National Fire Protection Association Standard 1144, Standard for Reducing Structure 
Ignition Hazards from Wildland Fire will be recognized by the Cambria Community Services 
District.  The amendments address the unique fire problems, concerns, and future directions, by 
which this District can establish and maintain an environment which will deliver an adequate level 
of fire and life safety protection to its citizens and visitors.   
 
Under the provisions of Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 of the Health and Safety Code, local 
amendments shall be based on climatic, geographical, or topographical conditions.  The findings 
contained herein shall address each of these situations and shall present the local situation, which, 
either singularly or in combination, cause the need for the amendments to be adopted. 
 
CAMBRIA COMMUNITY PROFILE 
 
In 1866, the Town of Cambria was established.  Cambria encompasses an area of approximately 5 
square miles, with a residential population of approximately 6500.  The physical location of 
Cambria is 1 mile north of Highway 46 West on California Highway 1 and immediately south of 
San Simeon Creek Road and California Highway 1, immediately adjacent to the Pacific Ocean.  
The majority of Cambria contains single-family residential housing, two distinct business areas, 
numerous hotels, motels and bed and breakfasts, as well as an elementary school, a middle school 
and a high school, and a small commercial business area.  Housing areas are spread across 
Cambria at elevations ranging from 10 to 600 feet above sea level. 
 
Traversing through Cambria is California State Highway 1 and the Pacific Ocean to the West.  
Another unique factor that can create a barrier is the possibility of an earthquake collapsing the 
Santa Rosa Creek bridges and San Simeon Creek Bridge, which would restrict access for 
emergency equipment. 
 
Based on this profile of Cambria, the Cambria Community Services District Fire Department 
(CCSDFD) established certain requirements to increase the level of fire safety to the citizens and 
visitors of Cambria, as well as the buildings and property within its boundaries.  The following 
points are factors which cause concern to the CCSDFD and are herein established and submitted 
as the findings: 
 

61



 2

1. CLIMATIC 
 

The climate and weather patterns within Cambria are considered to be directly affected by 
the on-shore winds from the Pacific Ocean, located immediately to the West.  Normal 
rainfall averages 20-25 inches annually.  During the winter rainy periods Cambria has the 
potential to experience flooding. The West business district flooded several years ago, 
interrupting emergency service response to this area and other parts of the community.  
During these flooding events it would be imperative that the community has automatic fire 
suppression systems to extinguish or control a fire to which the CCSDFD has a delayed 
response.  During the summer and fall months, temperatures average approximately 68 
degrees and can exceed 80 degrees for a period of days.  Dry winds can remove the 
moisture from vegetation.  Cambria has also experienced periods of drought which push 
fuel moisture levels to significantly low levels for long periods of time. It is well 
documented that coastal fuel models do not respond well to long periods of drought and 
low fuel moisture.  During late summer and fall, winds can move a fire quickly across the 
hills and/or through residential and commercial areas of Cambria.  
 
Because of weather patterns and limited water sources Cambria (like few other California 
communities) has long established and participated in water conservation programs to 
prevent water rationing. During some years water rationing has been instituted and 
required.  Water allocations may be reduced in the future due to limited storage capacity 
and increased consumption from increased population, as well as the climatic conditions 
which reduce the already minimal annual rainfall. Cambria’s present water storage 
capacity, at a minimum, is adequate for response to a single structure fire. Cambria 
experiences periods of low humidity, high temperature and winds each year. The age of the 
Cambria Pine Forest combined with diseases such as Pine Pitch Canker, create an 
environment where catastrophic wildland and resultant structural fires can occur. These 
conditions can create a situation where the Fire Department would commit limited 
resources to attempt to control and extinguish fire(s).  The coastal fuel model types that are 
prevalent in and around Cambria are GR-6, GR-7, and TU-5. As mentioned above, these 
fuel model types have a scientific history of poor recovery from drought or low humidity 
and warm, dry wind conditions. In these known fuel types it is well documented and 
observed that flying brands or burning embers from any fire can and will ignite many new 
fires. Since this is an obvious risk to our community, we must embrace ignition resistant 
exterior building construction features that protect the occupants as well as the surrounding 
wildland urban interface and intermix areas from this ever-present fire threat. These 
climatic conditions set the stage for potentially disastrous wildfire occurrences and threaten 
the public safety of the community.  Cambria has not experienced a significant wildfire in 
over 130 years. While sound management of the water resources is possible, actual 
demands on our water supply have and will most assuredly increase. 

 
2. GEOLOGICAL 

 
The geologic features offered by Cambria give residents and visitors alike great scenic 
appeal.  The coastline along the Pacific Ocean is emerging and is a rocky coast.  
 
The area in and around Cambria has considerable evidence of prior seismic activity. 
During the last several years earthquakes centered in Parkfield, San Simeon and Templeton 

62



 3

have caused significant seismic activity within Cambria. Several active faults are located to 
the East of Cambria and could result in damage occurring to the community. The 
disruption of streets and roadways due to seismic damage could delay the arrival of 
emergency fire response and allow fires to quickly escalate beyond the fire department’s 
ability to suppress them. The installation of automatic fire suppression systems would 
allow the ability for the system to take action prior to the fire department’s arrival. The 
potential for severe damage does exist for the entire built environment in the community 
but respective distances to such faults may limit damage in new construction where 
damage to older existing structures could be serious. 
 
Although the CCSDFD and water system in Cambria are currently rated Class-5 by the 
Insurance Services Offices (ISO) it is possible that major fire flow requirements could be 
disrupted and automatic fire suppression systems requiring much less water would be the 
only means of extinguishment.  Recent improvements to the community’s water storage 
system have occurred however our community still remains below current accepted 
standards for the required amount for fire protection.  The Cambria Community Services 
District (CCSD) is currently working toward a multi-year plan to improve the community 
water storage shortfall.  Until a more reliable and permanent water supply is secured, 
Cambria is in and will remain in a water shortage emergency. 
 
The potential for earthquakes influences fire protection planning.  A major seismic event 
would create a community-wide demand on fire protection services, which would be 
beyond the response capability of the fire department. Near shore and long distance 
Tsunami’s can and would flood and damage large sections of Cambria.  During flooding 
events it is well documented that building and other fires can and often do occur. This 
potential problem can be partially mitigated by requiring initial fire control through the 
installation of automatic fire protection systems. Extinguishing systems are instrumental in 
controlling or extinguishing fires in buildings in the event the water system is operating 
and undamaged by the seismic event. This increases the availability of firefighting 
resources to handle other emergencies during and after seismic events. 
 
The geological layout of Cambria’s hillside areas creates hazardous conditions should a 
storm or earthquake cause trees to fall and block roadways making access difficult or 
impossible until properly cleared. Landslides also frequently occur which can block 
ingress and egress. These conditions have occurred in the past and will happen again. 

 
3. TOPOGRAPHIC 

 
The topographic element of this report is associated closely with the geological element 
noted above.  While the geological features create the topographic conditions, the areas of 
findings in this Section are a result of the construction and design of Cambria. 
 
As the tourism activity in Cambria increases and parking lots fill with customers, delivery 
vehicles tend to double-park and add to congestion, which increases response times for 
emergency equipment. Most of Cambria’s road system is below current access standards 
and pose challenges for responding emergency vehicles. Vegetation grows near or over the 
roadways' edge and are prone to erosion, landslides, and blockages by falling trees.  These 
conditions have impacted the timely delivery of emergency fire response to the 

63



 4

community.  Local residents and visitors parking on or adjacent to already sub-standard 
streets create access problems and blockages for fire and emergency services. The 
requirement for automatic fire suppression systems, defensible space, ignition resistant 
exterior construction features and improved fire access would support the fire and life 
safety response. 
 
California Highway 1 completely traverses Cambria, creating a potential “barrier” to 
emergency response teams.  All roads must pass over Highway 1, which could be sensitive 
to collapse in the event of an earthquake.  In this instance, Cambria could be physically 
divided. 

 
The value of the land in Cambria is near the top in the County. Maximum usage of the land 
is important to property owners, investors and developers. The most effective method of 
achieving this is to allow large homes on small lots with Pine trees and vegetation all 
around the structures.  In numerous cases property is very sparingly cleared and a single 
residential dwelling is built in its place.  
 
The town of Cambria is currently a designated by Cal Fire as a high wildland fire severity 
zone. The rural nature of the town and the fact that a significant wildland fire has not 
occurred here in over 130 years places the community and visitors at significant risk.  
Narrow roads and steep hillsides increase response times and delay fire suppression efforts. 
The accumulation of combustible trees, dead vegetation, brush and grass create significant 
hazards and pose a severe burden on emergency response by the fire department. The 
potential for multiple fires would quickly overtax the CCSDFD ability to adequately 
provide service. The hillside location of homes, and the grouping together of numerous 
homes in a small area, also creates service delivery problems for the department. Fires 
occurring in these homes have a greater potential to spread to the wildland and therefore 
would expose additional structures to loss by fire.  
 
The physical isolation of the town of Cambria places neighboring fire departments 
significant distances away. When fire mutual aid is needed, the 30 minute average 
response time for neighboring jurisdictions to arrive from the East and South allows a 
significant amount of time for fires to grow and exceed the resource capability of the 
responding adjacent fire equipment. Therefore, requirements for built-in fire protection, 
defensible space, fuel reduction, ignition resistant exterior building features and improved 
access would significantly improve the fire and life safety for the residents and visitors of 
Cambria. 

 
STATEMENT OF THE PROBLEM 

 
The CCSDFD is charged with the task of providing a reasonable degree of fire and life 
safety protection to the citizens and visitors to our town. The continued development and 
growth of Cambria, as it relates to the delivery of fire protection, are of major concern if 
we are to continue to provide even a minimum level of fire protection to our community. 

 
These findings address the problem of community growth and cost of fire control while 
offering an alternative approach to the continually growing demand for publicly funded 
fire protection services.   

64



 5

 
A report by the Institute for Local Self-Government entitled “Alternative to Traditional 
Public Safety Delivery Systems,” finds that a fire chief must move toward built-in private 
fire protection equipment and systems if they are to control the fire department’s 
operational budget, and adequately address the community fire protection problem. 

 
This study, using guidelines from the Institute for Local Self-Government and the National 
Fire Protection Association, proposed that the fire department control fires in all new 
structures built within their jurisdiction. This could be accomplished by using an 
established emergency response assignment that will not create a deficiency in the fire 
protection services currently offered to the already established community. 

 
The CCSDFD’s emergency response assignment varies, depending on Paid-Call or 
Reserve Firefighter availability.  Most Fire Departments consider two engine companies, a 
rescue unit, an EMS unit (paramedics), and a Chief Officer to be a minimum emergency 
response assignment for a single-family structure fire. 

 
The CCSDFD’s daily staffing includes three personnel on a single Engine Company, and 
an Automatic Aid response from CAL Fire/San Luis Obispo County Fire, other adjacent 
agencies as well as available Paid Call Firefighters. It then seems only reasonable that new 
structures constructed or added onto, in Cambria, be protected by built-in fire protection 
systems.  The criteria for controlling the cost of fire protection in the CCSD is to cause (by 
ordinance) new structures, regardless of type of construction or occupancy, to be equipped 
with automatic fire sprinklers. 
 
The amending and adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code, the 2009 International 
Wildland Urban Interface Code and the NFPA Standard 1144 identifies a legally accepted, 
and recognized means to insure public safety and proper protection from fire. The adoption 
of these Codes together with the amendments provides a reasonable and established means 
of adequately protecting life, the environment and property in Cambria.   

 
These findings and future fire code provisions of the same kind reduce the need for large 
additions to publicly funded fire protection, and allow the CCSD to grow with reasonable 
expansion of the CCSDFD. They also place fire protection and prevention in the 
community where the benefit can be realized much quicker and with greater benefit.  

 
While smoke detectors are intended to provide an early warning that allows occupants to 
escape or defend themselves from the hazard of fire, automatic sprinklers are meant to 
control or extinguish a developing fire and to enable occupants to better escape. Automatic 
sprinklers are designed to respond quickly to suppress a fire, early in the fire’s 
development stages. This will allow for the suppression or extinguishment of a fire, and 
still leave a breathable atmosphere for occupants to safely exit the building. Automatic fire 
sprinklers can also contain the fire to the building of origin, and therefore potentially keep 
the fire from spreading to the exterior wildland environment. 

 
Based on these findings, Ordinance No.02-2010, will provide effective protection of the 
residents, the environment, as well as property, and help reduce the ravages of fire. 

 

65



 6

It should also be noted these findings are only a part of the total CCSD master fire 
protection plan.  This may be one of the single most important elements toward the 
progressive improvement of the delivery of fire and life safety/protection services. 

 
While the adoption of stringent regulations may not prevent all incidents of fire or deaths 
from fire, the implementation of the various codes and/or requirements will reduce the 
severity and potential for the loss of life, damage to the environment and property damage 
in our community. 

 
 

Prepared and submitted by:  Mark Miller, Cambria CSD Fire Chief 

66



 
 

CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 9.A. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010  Subject: Consider Adoption of Resolution 
         65-2010 Authorizing a Water  
         Loan Expenditure of $20,000  
         from CCSD General Fund  
         Reserves and Awarding Contract  
         to Bartle Wells Associates for 
         Financial Consulting Services 
___________________________________________________________________________ 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
 
Adopt Resolution 65-2010 authorizing a Water loan expenditure of $20,000 from CCSD 
General Fund Reserves awarding a contract to Bartle Wells Associates for financial consulting 
services.  
 
FISCAL IMPACT: 
 
$15,000 for professional financial consulting services; $1,000 for direct expenses (incidental 
and travel costs); and $4,000 for contingencies.  Total:  $20,000 
 
This is not a budgeted operating expense and, therefore, must come from the CCSD Reserve 
funds.  Since the Water Enterprise Fund has no Reserve funds, it must borrow them from the 
General Fund Reserves.  Therefore, staff recommends a Water loan from the CCSD General 
Fund Reserves.  
 
If, however, the CCSD Water Enterprise Fund is able to fund the contract from its operating 
funds in FY 2010/2011, staff will do so, without incurring another Water loan from CCSD 
General Fund Reserves.  (At least a portion of the contract amount might be possible to fund 
from Water operating funds due to staff vacancies.) 
 
BACKGROUND: 
 
At the August 19, 2010 regular meeting, the Board directed staff to retain professional financial 
and engineering consultants to provide expertise in order to facilitate the process of evaluating 
a proposed Desalination project, its costs, design, and feasibility. 
 
The Board formed an Ad Hoc Committee to oversee the process for selecting the financial and 
engineering consultants for the proposed Desalination project at its September 23, 2010, 
regular meeting.  That committee includes Directors DeMicco and MacKinnon. 
 
 

67



 
 
 
 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 
An RFP (Request for Proposal) was developed and transmitted on August 30, 2010, to several 
financial consulting services firms.  The CCSD received three (3) submittals by its published 
deadline on September 20, 2010, from: 
 
§ Bartle Wells Associates (Berkeley, CA) 
§ David Taussig & Associates (Newport Beach, CA) 
§ Pager, Sealy & Company, LLC (San Francisco, CA) 

 
Staff distributed copies of the proposals to Directors DeMicco and MacKinnon and then met 
with them on November 15, 2010.  After thorough research and review by the committee 
members and staff, the Board’s Ad Hoc Committee recommends that Bartle Wells Associates 
be awarded a contract to provide the financial consulting services.  Bartle Wells Associates 
has relevant public project financial consulting experience that best meets the CCSD’s 
objectives.  Theirs was also the most cost competitive of the submitters.  The Bartle Wells 
Associates proposal is attached for reference. 
 
 
Attachments:   Resolution 65-2010 
   Bartle Wells Associates 9/17/10 Proposal 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
 
UNANIMOUS:   ___ CLIFT ___ BAHRINGER ___ DE MICCO ___ MACKINNON ___THOMPSON ___ 
 

68



RESOLUTION 65-2010 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS 
OF THE CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 

AUTHORIZING A WATER LOAN EXPENDITURE OF $20,000 
FROM CCSD GENERAL FUND RESERVES AND AWARDING A CONTRACT 

TO BARTLE WELLS ASSOCIATES FOR FINANCIAL CONSULTING SERVICES 
 

 
The Board of Directors of the Cambria Community Services District does hereby 
resolve as follows: 
 

1. Authorizes a Water loan expenditure of $20,000 from CCSD General 
Fund Reserves, if necessary; and 

2. Awards a contract to Bartle Wells Associates of Berkeley, CA, for 
financial consulting services; and 

3. Authorizes the CCSD General Manager to sign the contract with Bartle 
Wells Associates.  

 
PASSED AND ADOPTED this 13th day of December 2010. 
 
 
 
      _______________________________ 
      President, Board of Directors 
 
 
ATTEST:     APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
 
       
Kathy A. Choate    Timothy J. Carmel 
District Clerk     District Counsel 

69



70



71



72



73



74



75



76



77



78



79



80



81



82



CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 9.B. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13, 2010 Subject:  Preliminary Discussion of 2011 CCSD  
        Board Goals 
___________________________________________________________________________ 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
 
Present DRAFT 2011 CCSD Board Goals and preliminarily discuss them. 
 
FISCAL IMPACT: 
 
None. 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 
Director Clift will lead today’s presentation and discussion.  DRAFT 2011 CCSD Board Goals 
include: 
 

1. Desalination for reliable water supply and coordination and support with the USACE 
(United States Army Corps of Engineers) project team. 

2. Develop and approve a formal Capital Improvement Program and funding source. 
3. Coordinate emergency medical services between the CCSD and CCHD (Cambria 

Community Healthcare District). 
4. Consider joint use for recreational activities between the CCSD and CUSD (Cambria 

Unified School District). 
5. Consider CCSD Administration reorganization, allowing for attrition. 
6. Analyze and consider new CCSD employee benefit structures. 
7. Initiate negotiations with labor groups:  SEIU (Service Employees International Union) 

Local 620, IAFF (International Association of Firefighters) Local 4635, and MCE 
(Management and Confidential Employees). 

 
The Board will finalize and establish its goals at the January 20, 2011 regular meeting. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
 
UNANIMOUS:   ___ CLIFT ___ BAHRINGER ___ DE MICCO ___ MACKINNON ___THOMPSON ___ 
 

83



CAMBRIA COMMUNITY SERVICES DISTRICT 
 

TO:  Board of Directors      AGENDA NO. 9.C. 
 
FROM: Tammy Rudock, General Manager 
  Kathy Choate, District Clerk 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Meeting Date: December 13 2010 Subject:  Appoint Ad Hoc Committee for CCSD 

Coordination of Services with Cambria  
Community Healthcare District (CCHD) 

___________________________________________________________________________ 
 
RECOMMENDATION: 
 
Appoint Ad Hoc Committee for CCSD coordination of services with CCHD. 
 
FISCAL IMPACT: 
 
None. 
 
DISCUSSION: 
 
Muril Clift will lead the discussion of this matter. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
BOARD ACTION: Date      Approved:     Denied:    
 
UNANIMOUS:   ___ CLIFT ___ BAHRINGER ___ DE MICCO ___ MACKINNON ___THOMPSON ___ 
 

84


	Agenda
	Accept Certification by San Luis Obispo County Clerk-Recorder of November 2, 2010 Election Results
	SR 1 E Cert Election Results 11210
	SR 1 E SLO Co Election Results

	MANAGER'S REPORT
	SR 6 A GM Report
	SR 6 A VSA Oct Nov Rpt
	SR 6 A Finance Mgr Rpt
	SR 6 A Finance Mgr Rpt Debt Sched
	SR 6 A UM Rpt
	SR 6 A 2010 San Simeon Creek Well Levels
	SR 6 A Fire Chief Rpt
	Fire Stats November

	DESALINATION AND WATER STORAGE FACILITIES REPORT - General Manager and/or District Engineer
	SR 6 B Desal Water Fac Rpt

	Approve Expenditures for Month of November 2010
	SR 7 A Expenditure Rpt November 2010
	SR 7 A Expenditure Rpt Dept Codes

	Approve Minutes of Board of Directors Meeting, Nov 10, 2010
	SR 7 B DRAFT CCSD Mins 111010

	Consider Adoption of Resolution 62-2010 Authorizing Banking Powers
	SR 7 C Approve Bank Signers Report
	SR 7 C Reso 62 2010 Appv Bank Signers HOB
	SR 7 C Bank Powers Attachment

	Consider Resolution 63-2010 Authorizing the Establishment of a Non-Interest Bearing Account at Heritage Oaks Bank
	SR 7 D Appv Overflow CCSD Bank Acct HOB
	SR 7 D Reso 63-2010 Overflow HOB Acct

	Consider Adoption of Resolution 64-2010 Authorizing Special Depository Agreement with Heritage Oaks Bank
	SR 7 E Appv Special Depository Agmnt HOB
	SR 7 E Reso 64 HOB Special Depository Agmnt

	Cast Ballot Electing Muril Clift as Special District Member to Local Agency Formation Commission (LAFCO) Term Expiring December 2012
	SR 7 F Cast Ballot LAFCO Clift
	SR 7 F LAFCO Ballot

	Consider Nomination of Muril Clift as Special District Member to the SLO County Integrated Waste Management Authority (IWMA)


	SR 7 G IWMA Nomination of Clift
	SR 7 G IWMA112310NomsEmail

	Public Hearing to Adopt Ordinance 02-2010 of the Board of Directors of the Cambria Community Services District Amending CCSD Code Chapter 6.04 and Adopting and Amending the 2010 Edition of the California Fire Code and 2009 Edition of the International Wildland Urban Interface Code and the National Fire Protection Association Standard 1144
	SR 8 A Adopt Ord 02 2010
	SR 8 A Ord Fire Code 2010
	SR 8 A Resolution 61 2010 Fire Code Findings
	SR 8 A Fire Code Attach2 Findings

	Consider Adoption of Resolution 65-2010 Authorizing a Water Loan Expenditure of $20,000 from CCSD Reserves and Awarding Contract to Bartle Wells Associates for Financial Consulting Services
	SR 9 A Author Water Loan Exp of GF Reserves Award Contract Bartle Wells Financial Consulting
	SR 9 A Reso 65 2010 AuthWaterLoanBartleWellsContract
	SR 9 A Bartle Wells Assoc Proposal

	Preliminary Discussion of 2011 CCSD Board Goals
	SR 9 B Prelim Disc 2011 CCSD Board Goals

	Appoint Ad Hoc Committee for CCSD Coordination of Services with Cambria Community Healthcare District CCHD)


	SR 9 C Appoint Ad Hoc Comm CCSD CCHD Coordination of Svcs


